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SECTION 14 METROPOLITAN DISTRICT 
 

2024 Budget Message 
Introduction 
Section 14 Metropolitan District (the “District”) was formed in 1987 for the purpose of 
providing streets, associated safety protection facilities, storm drainage and irrigation 
facilities, sanitary sewer and water facilities, and landscaping improvements.  All services 
are provided for property owners located within District boundaries. 
 
The District consists of approximately 177 acres located in Jefferson County, City and 
County of Denver, and the City of Lakewood. 
 
Under agreement with various jurisdictions, a majority of improvements have been 
dedicated to the respective jurisdictions.  
 
The 2024 budget was prepared in accordance with the Local Government Budget Law of 
Colorado.  The budget reflects the projected spending plan for the 2024 fiscal year based 
on available revenues.  This budget provides for the general operation of the District and 
capital expenses. 
   
Current District 
The District’s assessed value of non-excluded property increased to $74,624,535 from 
$66,016,930 in the prior year.  The District’s total mill levy is 11.000 mills in the City 
and County of Denver and in Jefferson County.  Property taxes are dedicated to the 
General Fund for tax collected in the 2024 fiscal year.    
 
Exclusions 
The District has excluded four parcels of real property from its boundaries (“Excluded 
Parcels”). The Excluded Parcels were responsible for servicing debt on the Series 2000 
General Obligation Variable Rate Refunding Bonds.  The mill levies for the Excluded 
Parcels were adjusted annually based on each exclusion’s responsible share of the annual 
debt service.  As of December 1, 2019, the District had no General Obligation Long-
Term Debt. As a result, the Westlake/Fairmark and Jefferson 1994 Exclusions have mill 
levies of 0.000 mills, and the Villages at Raccoon Creek and Grant Ranch Cove 
Exclusions have mill levies of 0.000 mills. 
 
Budgetary Basis of Accounting 
The District uses funds to budget and report on the financial position and results of 
operations.  Fund accounting is designed to demonstrate legal compliance and to aid 
financial management by segregating transactions related to certain governmental 
functions. The various funds determine the total District budget.  All of the District’s 
funds are considered governmental funds and are reported using the current financial 
resources and the modified accrual basis of accounting.   Revenues are recognized when 
they are measurable and available.  Revenues are considered available when they are 
collectible within the current period.  For this purpose, the District considers revenues to 
be available if they are collected within 60 days of the end of the current fiscal period.  
Expenditures, other than the interest on long term obligations, are recorded when the 



liability is incurred or the long-term obligation paid. 
 
Fund Summaries 
The General Fund is used to account for resources traditionally associated with 
government such as property taxes, specific ownership tax and expenditures which 
include district administration, legal services, and other expenses related to statutory 
operations of a local government. The District retains the services of a contract 
administrator to provide the on-going management of the District.  No change in the level 
of services from the current year is proposed.  In 1999, the District began contributing to 
the landscape maintenance responsibilities and anticipates that the level of service will 
continue to increase in the years ahead.  The District contributes for maintenance of 
monuments, storm drainage and landscape improvements. 
 
The Debt Service Fund is used to account for property taxes and other revenues 
dedicated to pay the fiscal year’s debt expense which includes principal payments, 
interest payments, and administrative costs associated with debt obligations. As of 
December 1, 2019, the District did not have any outstanding General Obligation Debt. 

 
The Capital Projects Fund is used to account for revenues and expenditures for capital 
projects.  In 2024, the Board budgeted $1,325,000 for capital projects.   

 
 
Emergency Reserve 
As required by Section 20 of Article X of the Colorado Constitution, the District has 
provided for an Emergency Reserve in the amount of 3% of the total fiscal year revenues 
in the General Fund. 
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